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Introduction 
The internet is a communication and information 

network with unprecedented influence; no other medium 
is as accessible to people worldwide.[1] More than 50% of 
all Internet traffic is related to sexual content. This is 
particularly concerning given the significant increase in 
pornography use among adults, youths, teenagers, and 
even children over the past few decades.[2] 

In general, pornography refers to written or visual 
material of an explicit sexual nature intended to arouse 
sexual feelings in the reader or viewer.[3] Failure to control 
pornography use can lead to emotional problems, such as 
feelings of guilt, shame, and regret, and is often 
characterized as problematic pornography use (PPU).[4] 

The proliferation of computers and smartphones has 
facilitated anonymous and unrestricted access to 
pornographic content 24 hours a day.[5] Consequently, 
teenagers and young adults may feel safer online, as their 

identities remain concealed, allowing them to seek out 
information about sexual relationships without fear of 
judgment. 

According to statistics from a prominent pornography 
website, over 42 billion visits were recorded in 2019.[6] 

Additionally, studies estimate the prevalence of 
pornography use to range between 19% and 84% across 
different countries.[7] 

Research indicates that gender is one of the strongest 
predictors of pornography use, with men more likely to 
engage with such content than women.[1,4,8] For instance, a 
study conducted in Sistan and Baluchistan, Iran, revealed 
that among a student population with an average age of 
22.35 years, 74% of men and 35% of women reported using 
pornography in the past year.[9] 

Despite the high prevalence of pornography use, there is 
limited research on protective factors that may mitigate its 
use among teenagers and young adults. Some identified 
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protective factors include higher parental education levels, 
greater socio-economic status, stronger school 
attachment, healthier family relationships, and more 
active family religious practices.[10] 

There is also growing evidence linking adolescent 
pornography viewing to negative health outcomes, 
including substance use, risky sexual behavior, aggression, 
sexual victimization, low self-esteem, depression, 
delinquency, objectification of women, and sexual 
deviance.[10] 

Religion has long been considered a protective factor 
against pornography use. Religious teachings often 
highlight the addictive and harmful nature of 
pornography, the moral degradation it can cause, and its 
negative effects on spiritual well-being.[11] Several studies 
have reported that religiosity-encompassing thoughts, 
feelings, and behaviors related to religious beliefs-serves as 
a protective factor against pornography use.[1,12,13] 

However, some studies suggest that religiosity may not 
always act as a deterrent against pornography use.[14] 

Alport considers religion to be a potentially significant 
factor in mental health. He distinguishes between internal 
and external religious orientations. In the case of internal 
religious orientation, faith is viewed as a transcendent 
value. Individuals with an internal religious orientation 
tend to live in harmony with their beliefs, which fosters 
greater social security and stability. Conversely, external 
religious orientation treats religion as a tool for fulfilling 
individual needs, such as status and security. In this 
context, individuals use religion as a means to achieve their 
personal goals. According to Allport and Ross, external 
religion is believed to have fewer therapeutic and 
preventive benefits compared to internal religion.[15,16] 

It is important to note that the phenomenon of 
pornography and its relationship to religiosity has been 
explored only in a limited manner, with most studies 
focusing predominantly on Christian populations.[17] 

Given the varying results of studies regarding the role of 
religious beliefs in pornography use, it is crucial to 
understand the reasons behind this inconsistency. Many 
studies have primarily included Christian participants, 
leaving out other religions such as Islam, Judaism, 
Buddhism, and others. A broader exploration is necessary 
to provide a comprehensive understanding of how 
religiosity relates to pornography use across different 
faiths. 

 
Objectives 

Therefore, the current research aims to investigate the 
relationship between internal and external religious 

orientations and pornography use within the Muslim 
population. Future studies should expand their scope to 
include various religious values, particularly those related 
to religiosity, in order to gain a deeper understanding of 
why individuals engage with pornography, especially 
considering that the majority of people identify as 
religious. 
 
Methods 

The current study is a descriptive-analytical cross-
sectional investigation involving students from various 
faculties of Kashan University of Medical Sciences during 
the academic year 2022-2023. The sample was selected 
using a cluster sampling method from different faculties. 
Inclusion criteria for participants required them to be 
students, Muslims, and over 18 years old. Exclusion 
criteria included incomplete or distorted questionnaires. 

Data collected comprised demographic information, two 
Allport religious orientation questionnaires, and the 
Problematic Pornography Use Scale (PPUS). The sample 
size was calculated using the formula proposed by 
Tabachnick and Fidell (8M + 50 ≥ N), where N represents 
the sample size and M denotes the number of predictor 
variables. Given that this study included two predictor 
variables, the minimum sample size was estimated to be 66 
participants. To account for potential incomplete 
responses, a total of 210 questionnaires were distributed. 

The questionnaires distributed among students included:  
a) Problematic Pornography Use Scale (PPUS): This 18-

item tool, developed by Booth et al. in 2018,[18] assesses the 
extent of pornography use over the past six months. 
Respondents rate their answers on a 7-point Likert scale 
ranging from 1 (never) to 7 (always). The minimum 
possible score on this scale is 18, while the maximum is 
126, with a cut-off score of 76 indicating problematic use. 
The reliability coefficient of this scale, assessed using 
Cronbach's alpha, is estimated at 0.93, and its validity has 
been supported through confirmatory factor analysis 
(GFI=0.97 and RMSEA=0.06). Hosseinzadeh and 
Hosseinabadi[19] reported reliability coefficients for the 
subscales of clarity and vividness (0.71), tolerance and 
resilience (0.84), mood change (0.88), recurrence and 
return (0.80), withdrawal (0.68), conflict (0.94), and the 
overall scale (0.94). They also confirmed its validity 
through confirmatory factor analysis (GFI=0.97 and 
RMSEA=0.05). 

b) Allport Religious Orientation Scale: Developed by 
Allport and Ross in 1967, this scale measures internal and 
external religious orientations. According to Allport's 
theory, internal religion is characterized by organized and 
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internalized principles, while external religion serves as a 
tool to satisfy individual needs such as status and 
security.[20] Early studies indicated a correlation of -0.21 
between external and internal orientations. The 
questionnaire consists of 20 items, with 11 items related to 
external religious orientation and 9 items pertaining to 
internal religious orientation. In 1964, Feigen created a 21-
item version of this test that can be administered in groups 
without a time limit.  

Responses are scored on a scale from completely agree to 
completely disagree, with scores ranging from 1 to 4. The 
sum of scores from items 1 to 12 indicates the degree of 
external religious orientation, while the sum of scores from 
items 13 to 21 reflects internal religious orientation. The 
validity of the questionnaire has been reported by 
Janbozorgi among Tehran University students, with a 
Cronbach's alpha coefficient of 0.74.[20] 

 

Data analysis 
The continuous variables were expressed as the mean ± 

SD, and the categorical variables were presented as a 
percentage and frequency. The relations between 
parameters were evaluated using the Pearson correlation 
coefficient. All statistical analyses were performed with 
SPSS (version 17.0, SPSS Inc, Chicago, IL, USA). A “P-
value” less than 0.05 was considered significant.  

 

Ethical considerations 
The study was conducted in accordance with the 

Declaration of Helsinki. All information collected was 
done anonymously to ensure that the participants' true 
identities remained confidential. Only the researchers 
involved in this study had access to the data. Prior to 
answering the research questions, participants provided 
informed consent, during which they received 
explanations regarding various aspects of confidentiality. 
They were assured that their information would only be 
used for the purposes of this research. This study was 
approved by the Ethical Committee at Kashan University 
of Medical Sciences (Ethical code: 
IR.KAUMS.REC.1401.215) 
 
Results 

A total of 201 students participated in this study, 
comprising 62.2% (125) males and 37.8% (76) females. 
Among the participants, 93% were single, 6.5% were 
married, and 0.5% were divorced. The participants' ages 
ranged from a minimum of 18 years to a maximum of 36 
years, with an average age of 21.68 years. In terms of 
educational level, 58.7% were enrolled in doctoral 

programs (medical students and PhD candidates), while 
48.3% were pursuing bachelor’s or master’s degrees. All 
students reported having daily access to the Internet, with 
63.7% indicating that they spent more than ten hours 
online each day. 

According to the results presented in Table 1, 88.4% of all 
students reported watching pornography (99.2% of boys 
and 77.6% of girls). 

 
Table 1. Pornography viewing by gender 

Gender Porn  Frequency Percentage 
Boy  I have not seen at all 1 0.8 

I have seen 124 99.2 
Total 125 100 

Girl I have not seen at all 17 22.4 
I have seen 59 77.6 
Total 76 100 

 
As shown in Table 2, 28.8% of male students visited 

pornographic websites daily or several times a week. In 
contrast, none of the female participants reported visiting 
such sites daily, and only 5.3% indicated they did so several 
times a week. 

 
Table 2. Frequency of pornography viewing by time and 

gender   
Gender Visit porn time Frequency Percentage 
Boy Once in 6 months 25 20 

Once a month 29 23 
Once a week 34 27.2 
Several times a week 26 20.8 
Every day or almost 
every day 

10 8 

Total 125 100 
Girl Once in 6 months 41 53.9 

Once a month 11 14.5 
Once a week 4 5.3 
Several times a week 4 5.3 
Every day or almost 
every day 

0 0 

Total 76 100 
 
Using the Problematic Pornography Use Scale, which has 

a minimum score of 18 and a maximum score of 126, a 
score of 76 or higher is considered indicative of 
problematic use. The results revealed that 11.9% of 
students scored above this cut-off point, suggesting 
problematic pornography use, with a higher prevalence 
observed among boys compared to girls (p=0.001) [Table 
3]. 
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The results of the Pearson correlation test [Table 4] 
indicated that internal religious orientation has a negative 
relationship with the frequency of pornography viewing 

(r=-0.155, p=0.028), while external religious orientation 
did not show a significant relationship (r=-0.043, 
p=0.543).

 

Table 3. Prevalence of pornography addiction among students by gender 
Groups Problematic pornography Total X2 

(sig) No Yes 
Gender Boy  Frequency  103 22 125 0.001 

Percentage  82.4% 17.6% 100% 
Girl  Frequency  74 2 76 

Percentage  97.4% 2.6% 100 % 
Total  Frequency  177 24 201 

Percentage  88.1% 11.9% 100 % 
 

Table 4. Mean, Standard deviation, and correlation between pornography use and religious orientation 
r Standard 

deviation 
Mean Topic 

3 2 1 
-0.155 * .043 1 22.74 47.28 1-Porn 
-0.697 ** 1 -0.043 5.62 29.52 2-External religious orientation  

1 -0.697** -0.155* 4.03 20.35 3-Internal religious orientation 
sig˂0.05* 
 

Discussion 
The primary aim of this study was to investigate whether 

religiosity serves as a protective factor against exposure to 
pornography. It was hypothesized that teenagers with 
stronger religious beliefs and motivations would exhibit 
more conservative attitudes toward pornography use. 

The findings indicated that individuals with a more 
internal religious orientation tend to use pornography less 
frequently. This result aligns with previous research 
demonstrating a negative correlation between religiosity 
and pornography use.[12, 21-23]  

Additionally, the study revealed that external religious 
orientation did not have a significant relationship with 
harmful pornography use, a finding consistent with other 
studies.[14, 8]  

In general, religious teachings promote conservative 
views on sexuality, which likely foster negative attitudes 
toward pornography use. Individuals with an internal 
religious orientation are more likely to adhere to these 
conservative values, potentially viewing pornography as 
morally wrong.[24]  

According to Allport and Ross, individuals with extrinsic 
religious orientations often use religion as a means to fulfill 
basic needs, employing it for non-religious purposes such 
as coping with challenges and enhancing their lives. In 
contrast, those with an internal religious orientation view 
religion as an end in itself. For these individuals, religion 
serves as a framework for social life, enabling them to 
better understand and navigate immoral situations.[16] 

Consequently, it can be concluded that external religious 
orientation does not act as a protective factor against 
pornography use. 

Furthermore, Cooper et al.,[25] identified three factors-
Internet access, affordability, and anonymity-that may 
explain why extrinsic religious orientation does not 
provide protection against pornography viewing. 
Specifically, individuals with an external religious 
orientation who utilize religion primarily to meet social 
needs may feel less threatened by the anonymity of the 
internet, leading them to engage in behaviors that do not 
align with their religious values. As a result, this type of 
religious orientation may lack a protective role regarding 
harmful pornography use. 

Overall, the current study found that a higher 
internalized religious orientation is associated with a lower 
likelihood of using pornography. However, it is important 
to note that the correlation between internal religious 
orientation and pornography use was weak, suggesting 
that numerous other factors may influence this 
relationship, warranting further investigation in future 
research. Additionally, this study did not differentiate 
between intentional and unintentional pornography use; 
some participants may have encountered explicit content 
accidentally. Future studies should consider this 
distinction. 

Given the relatively high prevalence of pornography 
viewing among students despite religious teachings in this 
area, further research is essential to explore why 
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individuals with an internal religious orientation still 
engage in pornography use. 

The results of this study indicate that 88.4% of 
participants reported having visited pornographic 
websites. The prevalence of pornography use was notably 
higher among boys (99%) compared to girls (77.6%). 
Various studies have reported differing rates of 
pornography use. For instance, research conducted at a 
Dutch university found that 83.8% of students viewed 
pornography, with exposure rates of 78.4% for females and 
79% for males.[26] Additionally, a systematic review 
covering the years 1995 to 2015 reported that the 
prevalence of pornography use among teenagers ranged 
from 19% to 84%.[27] These findings highlight the 
significant prevalence of pornography use among 
students. 

The current generation of students has grown up in the 
digital age, which may contribute to their increased 
exposure to pornographic content due to easy access to the 
Internet. Given that sexual exploration and the pursuit of 
intimate relationships typically occur during late 
adolescence and young adulthood, it is not surprising that 
students utilize the Internet for these purposes. 

It is important to note that variations in results may stem 
from differences in study populations and cultural 
backgrounds. The high prevalence of pornography use 
observed in this study may also be attributed to increased 
Internet access among students during and after the 
COVID-19 pandemic, compared to earlier research 
periods. 

Another significant finding of this study is that 11.9% of 
participants reported problematic pornography use, with 
a higher prevalence among boys (17.6%) compared to girls 
(2.6%). This aligns with previous research on the topic.[30-

32] Summer-Emerson et al.,[33] attempted to explain these 
gender differences from an evolutionary perspective, 
suggesting that men’s higher aggression levels may lead to 
increased pornography use compared to women. They 
noted that these differences could be influenced by 
biological factors, such as elevated testosterone levels in 
men, as well as social issues or cultural restrictions 
affecting both genders. Additionally, sexual neuroimaging 
studies indicate that women exhibit a weaker response to 
visual erotic stimuli.[33] 

Finally, it is important to acknowledge that data for this 
study were collected using a self-report questionnaire, 
which may have led participants to respond in a manner 
they perceived as socially desirable. Therefore, future 
research should consider employing alternative methods, 
such as interviews, to obtain more accurate results. Given 

that the sample consisted solely of university students, it 
would also be beneficial to expand this research to include 
individuals from diverse age groups and educational 
backgrounds to enhance the validity of the findings. 
Another limitation of this study is the lack of consideration 
for psychiatric disorders, as well as its cross-sectional and 
correlational design, which limits the ability to establish 
causal relationships. 
 
Conclusions 

The results of this study indicate a high prevalence of 
students visiting pornographic websites and engaging in 
problematic pornography use. Conversely, the findings 
suggest that internalized religious beliefs may serve as a 
protective factor against pornography use. To further 
understand this relationship, we recommend exploring the 
specific aspects of religious beliefs that influence 
pornography use among these populations.  
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